
$799,000 - 218 Elizabeth Street, Orangeville
MLS® #W12376786 

$799,000
5 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Orangeville, Orangeville, Ontario

Welcome to 218 Elizabeth Street, Orangeville -
a beautifully renovated detached brick
bungalow duplex nestled on a generous 50 ft x
142 ft mature lot. This impressive property
features a newer roof(2020), a private
inground pool, lush landscaped gardens, and
an interlocking stone patio, creating the perfect
outdoor oasis. A large workshop on-site offers
incredible potential for hobbyists or
handypersons. Inside, the main floor has been
professionally updated in 2025 with new
hardwood flooring, a modern kitchen with
quartz countertops and stainless steel
appliances, three spacious bedrooms with
built-in closets and new windows overlooking
the mature treed property, a new sleek
three-piece bathroom, and the convenience of
main floor laundry. The lower level offers a
fully self-contained apartment with its own
private entrance - ideal for rental income or
multi-generational living. This suite includes
two bedrooms, a full kitchen with granite
countertops, a three-piece bathroom, and
in-unit laundry. Located in a family-friendly
neighborhood, you're within walking distance
to schools, parks, restaurants, and more.
Whether you're a first-time homebuyer or an
investor seeking a turn-key opportunity, this
home offers exceptional value and versatility.
(id:6289)

Essential Information



Listing # W12376786

Price $799,000

Bedrooms 5

Bathrooms 2.00

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Bungalow

Community Information

Address 218 Elizabeth Street

Subdivision Orangeville

City Orangeville

Province Ontario

Postal Code L9W1C8

Amenities

Amenities Hospital, Place of Worship, Schools

Utilities Cable, Electricity, Sewer

Features In-Law Suite

Parking Spaces 4

Parking Detached Garage, Garage

# of Garages 2

Has Pool Yes

Pool Inground pool

Interior

Appliances Oven - Built-In, Dishwasher, Dryer, Two stoves, Washer, Two
Refrigerators

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

# of Stories 1

Basement Apartment in basement, Separate entrance

Exterior

Exterior Brick

Lot Description 50 x 142.5 FT|under 1/2 acre

Foundation Poured Concrete

Listing Details
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