
$1,629,999 - 2095 Grand Ravine Drive, Oakville (ro River
Oaks)
MLS® #W12368176 

$1,629,999
5 Bedroom, 4.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

1015 - RO River Oaks, Oakville (ro River
Oaks), Ontario

Welcome to 2095 Grand Ravine Dr, a
beautifully maintained home in one of
Oakville's most desirable and family-friendly
neighborhoods. This residence boasts an
exceptional layout with bright and spacious
living and dining areas, a modern kitchen with
ample cabinetry, and large windows that fill the
home with natural light. One of the bedrooms
has been thoughtfully transformed into a
luxurious walk-in closet, providing an elegant
and highly functional spaceto perfectly
organize an entire family's wardrobe. Upstairs,
you will find well-proportioned bedrooms,
including a generous primary suite, along with
updated bathrooms designed for every day
comfort. The finished basement offers
additional versatile space, ideal for a family
room or gym. Outside, the private backyard is
perfect for both relaxation and entertaining.
With its excellent floor plan and unbeatable
location close to major shopping centers,
grocery stores, restaurants, top-rated schools,
parks, and easy highway access, this home
offers the perfect combination of comfort,
lifestyle, and convenience. Dont miss the
opportunity to make 2095 Grand Ravine Dr
your next home! (id:6289)

Essential Information



Listing # W12368176

Price $1,629,999

Bedrooms 5

Bathrooms 4.00

Half Baths 1

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 2095 Grand Ravine Drive

Subdivision 1015 - RO River Oaks

City Oakville (ro River Oaks)

Province Ontario

Postal Code L6H6B5

Amenities

Utilities Cable, Electricity, Sewer

Features Carpet Free

Parking Spaces 4

Parking Attached Garage, Garage

# of Garages 2

Interior

Appliances Dishwasher, Dryer, Stove, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Stories 2

Has Basement Yes

Exterior

Exterior Brick

Lot Description 39.4 x 111.7 FT|under 1/2 acre

Foundation Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX ATRIUM HOME REALTY
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