
$758,900 - 36 Daffodil Road, Springwater (midhurst)
MLS® #S12443103 

$758,900
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Midhurst, Springwater (midhurst), Ontario

Welcome to your dream home in Midhurst
Valley, built by Geranium Homes and ready for
immediate move-in! This stunning property
features 3 bedrooms and 2.5 bathrooms,
including a luxurious primary suite with a
raised tray ceiling, glass shower, and
free-standing soaker tub. The open-concept
media room on the second floor provides a
perfect space for relaxation and
entertainment.The kitchen boasts Caesarstone
countertops, upgraded tiles, and comes fully
equipped with a fridge, stove, dishwasher,
washer, and dryer. Elegant 5 1/4 baseboards
add a touch of sophistication in the
home.Enjoy the convenience of being close to
parks and schools in a community ideal for
families and young couples. Experience
Barries urban energy alongside the unique
four-season adventures of Lake Simcoe.
Midhurst Valley offers the perfect blend of
tight-knit community living with endless
opportunities for outdoor fun. Come and settle
down in this beautiful home and embrace the
lifestyle you've always desired! (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # S12443103

Price $758,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Half Baths 1



Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 36 Daffodil Road

Subdivision Midhurst

City Springwater (midhurst)

Province Ontario

Postal Code L9X2E1

Amenities

Features Sump Pump

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Appliances Dryer, Washer

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

# of Stories 2

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Stone

Lot Description 25 x 98.4 FT

Foundation Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office RIGHT AT HOME REALTY
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