
$3,098,000 - 3823 Michener Way, North Vancouver
MLS® #R3057270 

$3,098,000
6 Bedroom, 5.00 Bathroom, 4,864 sqft
Single Family on 0.25 Acres

N/A, North Vancouver, British Columbia

Absolutely stunning unobstructed view from
this custom built home by Rantz Construction
in the distinctive Braemar subdivision. Truly
one of the premium lots boasting incredible
views of Mt Baker to City! A gorgeous 3 level
traditional plan showcasing nearly 5000 sq ft.
A real standout with extensive oak hardwood
flooring, vaulted grand entry with curved
staircase, beautiful molding detail with coffered
ceilings and fully renovated gourmet kitchen,
high end SS appliances, gas cook top island
and adjoining eating area. Expansive space
leading to large view deck from the family
room and a private patio area to rear. Room
for the whole family with 4 bdrms up incl.
grand master with intimate fireplace and
incredible panoramic outlook with remodelled
bathroom that rounds out this stunning
residential package! (id:6289)

Built in 1996

Essential Information

Listing # R3057270

Price $3,098,000

Bedrooms 6

Bathrooms 5.00

Square Footage 4,864

Acres 0.25

Year Built 1996

Type Single Family



Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 3823 Michener Way

Subdivision N/A

City North Vancouver

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V7K3C7

Amenities

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Garage

# of Garages 2

View View

Interior

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 3

Listing Details

Listing Office Macdonald Realty
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