
$1,880,000 - 1209 1768 Cook Street, Vancouver
MLS® #R2779913 

$1,880,000
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 972 sqft
Single Family

N/A, Vancouver, British Columbia

Enjoy uncompromised luxury with this 2
bedroom+1 den unit in the newly completed
Avenue One by Concord Pacific. Thoughtfully
finished from top to bottom with Miele
appliances, central air conditioning, marble
backsplash up to the ceilings, built-in kitchen
and closet organizers/ fittings, valance lighting.
Den is big enough for use as office or guest
bed. Building offers exercise centre, party
lounge with kitchen and pool table, pet
grooming centre, and automated car wash!
Location is second to none with Chinatown,
Mount Pleasant, Olympic Village Station,
South False Creek Seawall, Science World, all
within minutes. You don't need a car, but we
have a parking stall for you with private EV
charging. School catchment: elementary:
Simon Fraser Elementary; Secondary: Eric
Hamber Secondary. (id:6289)

Built in 2021

Essential Information

Listing # R2779913

Price $1,880,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 972

Year Built 2021

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Strata



Community Information

Address 1209 1768 Cook Street

Subdivision N/A

City Vancouver

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V5Y0N3

Amenities

Amenities Marina, Recreation, Shopping, Laundry - In Suite, Recreation Centre

Features Central location, Elevator

Parking Underground

View View

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Waterfront

Interior

Interior Features Drapes/Window coverings

Appliances All

Heating Heat Pump

Cooling Air Conditioned

Exterior

Exterior Features Garden Area

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Westcoast
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