
$275,000 - 7164 Route 102 Route, Central Greenwich
MLS® #NB122526 

$275,000
4 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 1,042 sqft
Single Family on 1.50 Acres

N/A, Central Greenwich, New Brunswick

Discover comfort and room to grow in this
beautifully updated 3-bedroom home, ideally
situated in Central Greenwich. Sitting on 1.5
acres, it offers the perfect balance of indoor
charm and outdoor space. Step inside to a
warm, inviting layout featuring a blend of
modern updates and timeless touches,
including gleaming hardwood and ceramic
flooring. The bright, functional kitchen is
complete with a walk-in pantryperfect for
added storage and everyday convenience.
The lower level features a spacious rec room
with brand-new flooring, ideal for family movie
nights, playtime, or your own private retreat.
Outdoors, the opportunities are endless. With
two driveways, two versatile outbuildings for
storage or hobbies, plenty of gardening, and
plenty of open space to enjoy, this property is
ready to adapt to your lifestyle. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # NB122526

Price $275,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 1.00

Square Footage 1,042

Acres 1.50

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Bungalow



Community Information

Address 7164 Route 102 Route

Subdivision N/A

City Central Greenwich

Province New Brunswick

Postal Code E5M2L8

Interior

Heating Baseboard heaters

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Vinyl

Listing Details

Listing Office EXIT Realty Specialists
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