
$799,999 - 852 Beatrice Street E, Oshawa (pinecrest)
MLS® #E12457877 

$799,999
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Pinecrest, Oshawa (pinecrest), Ontario

Welcome to 852 Beatrice Street East, a
beautifully maintained family home located in a
highly desirable, mature neighbourhood of
Oshawa!This charming property offers the
perfect blend of comfort, functionality, and
modern style  ideal for growing families or
anyone seeking a warm and inviting place to
call home.Step inside to find a bright and
Spacious 3-Level Sidesplit layout, featuring a
sun-filled living area, a modern kitchen with
ample cabinetry and skylight, and a cozy
space perfect for everyday living or
entertaining guests. The home boasts
well-sized bedrooms, updated bathrooms, and
plenty of natural light throughout.Enjoy outdoor
living in your private, fully fenced backyard 
perfect for summer BBQs, gardening, or
simply relaxing. A large driveway and attached
garage provide ample parking.Located close
to great schools, parks, shopping, restaurants,
transit, and major highways, this home offers
the convenience of city living with the comfort
of a quiet residential street. Don't miss your
chance to own this fantastic property  a true
turn-key home in a prime location! Finished
Basement with Separate Entrance and
Converted In-Law Suite (Not Legally
Retrofitted).Basement has separate laundry
room. Direct Garage Access to Home and 
garage has laundry as well. Ample Storage
Throughout and lots of outside storage and
Garden Shed.Conveniently Located Near Hwy
401, Oshawa Centre, Ontario Tech University,
and Durham College. Excellent Opportunity for



First time home buyers, Large Families,
Investors or End Users! (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # E12457877

Price $799,999

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 852 Beatrice Street E

Subdivision Pinecrest

City Oshawa (pinecrest)

Province Ontario

Postal Code L1K2H7

Amenities

Features In-Law Suite

Parking Spaces 5

Parking Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Appliances All

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

Has Basement Yes

Basement Separate entrance

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Vinyl siding

Lot Description 52.2 x 111.1 FT
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