
$699,000 - 970 Renaissance Drive, Oshawa (lakeview)
MLS® #E12437305 

$699,000
4 Bedroom, 4.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Lakeview, Oshawa (lakeview), Ontario

Welcome to this spacious 3+1 bedroom, 4
bathroom detached home with double garage
in Oshawa's highly sought-after Lakeview
community. Step inside to a bright, functional
layout featuring an eat-in kitchen with walkout
to a large deck and private, fully fenced yard- 
no neighbours behind! The inviting sunken
family room with bay window overlooks the
mature yard, while the combined living/dining
area offers the perfect space for entertaining.
Upstairs, you'll find three generous bedrooms,
including a primary suite with private ensuite,
double closets, and access to an upper
balcony. The finished basement adds even
more living space with a large rec room,
additional bedroom, and 3-piece bath. Direct
access from the double garage enhances
everyday convenience. Just one block from
the waterfront trail and lakefront park, and
minutes to top-rated schools, GO Transit,
shopping, and the 401, this home is perfectly
situated. The Lakeview community is known
for its family-friendly atmosphere, waterfront
lifestyle, and close-knit neighbourhood feel,
making this property an excellent choice for
families or investors alike. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # E12437305

Price $699,000

Bedrooms 4



Bathrooms 4.00

Half Baths 1

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 970 Renaissance Drive

Subdivision Lakeview

City Oshawa (lakeview)

Province Ontario

Postal Code L1J8E8

Amenities

Parking Spaces 4

Parking Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Appliances Dishwasher, Dryer, Hood Fan, Stove, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Stories 2

Has Basement Yes

Exterior

Exterior Aluminum siding, Brick

Lot Description 45 x 111.9 FT

Foundation Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office CENTURY 21 ATRIA REALTY INC.
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