
$895,000 - 1280 Andover Drive, Oshawa (eastdale)
MLS® #E12422631 

$895,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Eastdale, Oshawa (eastdale), Ontario

A True Pride of Ownership in Desirable
Eastdale! Welcome to this beautifully
maintained detached home, offering
3+1bedrooms and 3 bathrooms, located in one
of Eastdale's most sought-after
neighborhoods. From its thoughtful upgrades
to its warm, inviting layout, this home is ready
to impress .The heart of the home is the
modern kitchen (2015), showcasing quartz
countertops, a granite composite double sink,
and sleek finishes perfect for everyday living
and entertaining. The living room features
elegant crown moulding, while the sunken
family room provides a cozy retreat with
vaulted ceilings, a gas fireplace, and walkout
access to the private backyard. Enjoy peace of
mind with numerous upgrades, including
:Updated kitchen (2015),High-efficiency HVAC
system (2019),Roof replacement
(2011),Renovated bathrooms. The fully
finished basement adds valuable living space,
complete with a separate bedroom, spacious
recreation area, and ample storage ideal for a
home office, guest suite, or multi-generational
living. Step outside to a generously sized
backyard featuring interlocking stone work
perfect for entertaining or enjoying quiet
evenings. All this, just minutes from schools,
shopping, major highways, and everyday
conveniences. Don't miss this rare opportunity
book your private showing today and
experience the charm of this exceptional
home! (id:6289)



Essential Information

Listing # E12422631

Price $895,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Half Baths 1

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 1280 Andover Drive

Subdivision Eastdale

City Oshawa (eastdale)

Province Ontario

Postal Code L1K2K3

Amenities

Parking Spaces 3

Parking Attached Garage, Garage

# of Garages 2

Interior

Appliances Water Heater

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Stories 2

Has Basement Yes

Exterior

Exterior Brick

Lot Description 29.5 x 116.5 FT

Foundation Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX REALTY SERVICES INC.
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