
$1,000 - 33 - 1740 Simcoe Unit 1 Street, Oshawa (samac)
MLS® #E12348020 

$1,000
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family

Samac, Oshawa (samac), Ontario

Welcome home to this beautifully appointed
townhouse situated right next to the University
of Oshawa, Ontario. This inviting shared
accommodation is a perfect blend of comfort
and convenience, offering residents a prime
location in the heart of the city. Step outside
and find yourself just a short stroll away from
the university campus, making it an ideal spot
for students or faculty. You'll also enjoy
seamless access to public transportation,
top-rated schools, local shopping, and a host
of urban amenities that cater to your daily
needs. Inside, the townhouse offers a
welcoming atmosphere with thoughtfully
designed living spaces that make it easy to
feel right at home. Whether you're studying,
working, or simply relaxing, you' 11 appreciate
the balance of community living and urban
accessibility that this property provides.
Embrace a lifestyle of ease and opportunity in
a location that truly places everything at your
fingertips. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # E12348020

Price $1,000

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Condominium/Strata

Community Information



Address 33 - 1740 Simcoe Unit 1 Street

Subdivision Samac

City Oshawa (samac)

Province Ontario

Postal Code L1G4Y3

Amenities

Parking No Garage

Interior

Appliances Dryer, Stove, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Exterior

Exterior Brick

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX MILLENNIUM REAL ESTATE
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