
$75,000 - 217 Admirals Cove Road, Cape Broyle
MLS® #1288170 

$75,000
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 500 sqft
Recreational on 0.09 Acres

N/A, Cape Broyle, Newfoundland & Labrador

Looking for a peaceful, tranquil getaway, this
cosy cabin sits on the edge of the Atlantic
Ocean, where you can walk to the local beach
and enjoy nature at his finest. Located just one
hour from St. Johnâ€™s in scenic Admirals
Cove along the Irish Loop Drive .Enjoy the
amazing people and Newfoundland hospitality.
This property was previously used as a
successful Airbnb with people travelling from
all over the world and enjoying the experience
of the local community. Smell the saltwater air
of a coastal experience as you watch the
whales frolicking ,experience the beautiful
sunrise and sunsets as you sit on your front
deck and enjoy the moment. Breathtaking
views that are indescribable. This property has
an open concept kitchen ,living room one
bedroom and full bath could be used as a
weekend getaway, summer retreat or year
around living. There  is an additional concrete
pad that could be used to build a garage.
(id:6289)

Built in 1940

Essential Information

Listing # 1288170

Price $75,000

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00

Square Footage 500

Acres 0.09



Year Built 1940

Type Recreational

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 217 Admirals Cove Road

Subdivision N/A

City Cape Broyle

Province Newfoundland & Labrador

Postal Code A0A1P0

Amenities

View Ocean view, View

Interior

Appliances Stove

Heating Baseboard heaters

Exterior

Exterior Vinyl siding

Foundation Stone, Wood

Listing Details

Listing Office HomeLife Experts Realty Inc.
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