
$829,900 - 3 Wood Duck Way, Osoyoos
MLS® #10365572 

$829,900
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,400 sqft
Single Family on 0.12 Acres

Osoyoos, Osoyoos, British Columbia

Coming Early 2026 â€“ Brand New 4-Bedroom
Home in the Heart of Osoyoos! Be the first to
own this fabulous new construction home,
thoughtfully designed for modern living and
ready for move-in early 2026. Offering 2,349
sq. ft. of well-planned space across two levels,
this beautiful residence features 4 bedrooms,
3 bathrooms, and an open-concept layout
ideal for families or those who love to
entertain. Located just steps from downtown
Osoyoos, youâ€™ll enjoy easy access to
shops, restaurants, beaches, and all the local
charm this vibrant community has to offer.
Inside, expect contemporary finishes, quality
craftsmanship, and a functional floor plan. The
main level boasts bright, open living areas,
perfect for gatherings or quiet evenings at
home. Upstairs, you'll find three spacious
bedrooms plus a luxurious primary suite
complete with a private en-suite bath.
Additional highlights include a large laundry
room, single-car garage, and thoughtful design
touches throughout that bring comfort and
style together. Whether you're looking to settle
down or invest in a growing area, this property
offers the perfect blend of urban convenience
and tranquil livingâ€”all in a brand new home
tailored to meet the needs of modern life.
(id:6289)

Built in 2025

Essential Information



Listing # 10365572

Price $829,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 2,400

Acres 0.12

Year Built 2025

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Community Information

Address 3 Wood Duck Way

Subdivision Osoyoos

City Osoyoos

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V0H1V5

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Attached Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Heating Heat Pump, See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

# of Stories 2

Exterior

Roof Asphalt shingle

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Realty Solutions
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