
$699,800 - 7812 Gravenstein Drive, Osoyoos
MLS® #10365223 

$699,800
4 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 2,134 sqft
Single Family on 0.17 Acres

Osoyoos, Osoyoos, British Columbia

DOWNTOWN LOCATION! RECENTLY
UPDATED! MOVE-IN READY! This charming
home features modern upgrades throughout
and an unfinished basement offering endless
potential to customize and create your ideal
space. Convenience is key, with a prime
location within walking distance to town,
providing easy access to shops, restaurants,
and local amenities. Inside, the home exudes
warmth, comfort, and functionality, with a
thoughtful open-concept layout ideal for both
everyday living and entertaining. Step outside
to discover the professionally landscaped front
and rear yards, designed with care to create a
welcoming ambiance. The private backyard is
the perfect retreat for outdoor gatherings or
peaceful relaxation. Schedule your showing
today and make this beautifully updated home
your very own! (id:6289)

Built in 1966

Essential Information

Listing # 10365223

Price $699,800

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 1.00

Square Footage 2,134

Acres 0.17

Year Built 1966

Type Single Family



Sub-Type Freehold

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 7812 Gravenstein Drive

Subdivision Osoyoos

City Osoyoos

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V0H1V0

Amenities

Amenities Golf Nearby, Park, Recreation, Schools, Shopping, Ski area

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Additional Parking, Other

View Valley view

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Other

Interior

Heating Electric Forced air, See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Wood

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Stucco

Exterior Features Landscaped

Roof Asphalt shingle

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Realty Solutions
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