
$594,900 - 6035 Turner Avenue, Peachland
MLS® #10363388 

$594,900
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,691 sqft
Single Family on 0.25 Acres

Peachland, Peachland, British Columbia

Welcome to 6035 Turner Avenue - the
best-priced single-family home in Peachland! 
Nestled in a quiet neighbourhood just steps
from Turner Park and hiking trails, this 3
bedroom, 2 bathroom home offers unbeatable
value for first-time buyers or those looking to
downsize without giving up outdoor living.  The
main floor features an updated kitchen with
gas stove, stainless steel appliances and a
large island, perfect for entertaining, along with
an open living/dining area that flows
seamlessly to an oversized covered deck
where you can enjoy peek-a-boo lake views.
Two bedrooms and a full updated bathroom
complete the main level.  Downstairs,
youâ€™ll find a cozy family room, versatile
third bedroom along with another full
bathroom, complete with heated floors, and a
convenient spacious laundry room. The
outdoor space provides plenty of room for
gardening, relaxing, or pets.  An excellent
opportunity to own a detached home in
Peachland at an affordable price point! 
Abundance of parking for vehicles too and
priced well below asssessed value of
$720,000! (id:6289)

Built in 1978

Essential Information

Listing # 10363388

Price $594,900



Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,691

Acres 0.25

Year Built 1978

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 6035 Turner Avenue

Subdivision Peachland

City Peachland

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V0H1X4

Amenities

Parking Spaces 6

Parking Carport, Rear, RV

# of Garages 1

Interior

Heating Forced air, See remarks

# of Stories 1

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Royal LePage Kelowna
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