
$1,250,000 - 6555 Sherburn Road, Peachland
MLS® #10362839 

$1,250,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 3,283 sqft
Single Family on 0.30 Acres

Peachland, Peachland, British Columbia

Welcome to 6555 Sherburn Road in beautiful
Peachland! This stunning home offers just
under 3,300 sq. ft. of open-concept living,
designed with both elegance and functionality
in mind. The main level is a true showstopper,
featuring vaulted ceilings, two kitchen islands,
sleek stainless steel appliances, and a 6
burner gas Italian stoveâ€”a chefâ€™s dream.
Expansive windows throughout flood the home
with natural light, creating a bright and
welcoming atmosphere. The spacious primary
suite and second bedroom provide comfort
and privacy, complemented by the
convenience of separate laundry. Downstairs,
a bright and spacious two-bedroom suite
awaits with large windows that fill the space
with even more light. This level also boasts its
own patio with amazing viewsâ€”perfect for
morning coffee or relaxing evenings. Complete
with separate laundry, itâ€™s an ideal setup
for extended family, guests, or income
potential. Enjoy the outdoors year-round with
two balconies plus a cozy back patio that is
complete with a gas hookupsfor barbecues
and evenings by the fire. Parking and storage
are a breeze with a 670 sq. ft. garage, ideal for
vehicles, hobbies, or a workshop. The
generous driveway provides room for six or
more cars, with RV parking off to the
sideâ€”perfect for visitors or those who love to
travel. Tucked away in a quiet, sought-after
neighborhood, this entertainerâ€™s home is
ideal for families, multi-generational living, or
anyone looking for a serene Peachland



lifestyle. (id:6289)

Built in 1983

Essential Information

Listing # 10362839

Price $1,250,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Square Footage 3,283

Acres 0.30

Year Built 1983

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 6555 Sherburn Road

Subdivision Peachland

City Peachland

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V0H1X7

Amenities

Features Central island, Two Balconies

Parking Spaces 8

Parking Additional Parking, Attached Garage, See Remarks

# of Garages 2

View City view, Lake view, Mountain view, Valley view, View (panoramic)

Interior

Appliances Refrigerator, Dishwasher, Dryer, Range - Electric, Range - Gas,
Microwave, Washer

Heating See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Fireplaces Gas

# of Stories 1



Exterior

Exterior Brick, Other

Exterior Features Underground sprinkler

Roof Asphalt shingle

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Royal LePage Kelowna
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