
$799,000 - 375 Raven Ridge Road Unit# 301, Big White
MLS® #10362621 

$799,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,216 sqft
Single Family on 1.00 Acres

Big White, Big White, British Columbia

Incredible three bedroom two bathroom corner
unit in the sought after Stonegate complex!
This stunning condo features lavish finishings
including a gourmet kitchen with granite
counters, stainless steel appliances, and eat-in
kitchen. Fabulous for entertaining and family
time with a spacious and bright living area with
cozy fireplace to relax by. Or take it up a notch
and relax in the private hot tub boasting views
of the Monashee Mountains. This is a
completely turn key residence including
electronics, artwork, lines and more.
Stonegate offers incredible amenities like a
fitness centre, heated pool and hot tub, movie
theater, game lounge and kids play center!
Something for everyone to enjoy. Take
advantage of the newly expanded accessibility
to Big White, with direct flights from Los
Angeles, Toronto, and Montreal via Alaska
Airlines. Just an hour from YLW, immerse
yourself in a winter wonderland renowned for
the best snow in North America. Whether
youâ€™re looking for a personal getaway or a
lucrative investment, this condo is an
exceptional choice, fully exempt from the
Foreign Buyer Ban, Foreign Buyers Tax,
Speculation Tax, Empty Home Tax, and
Short-Term Rental Ban. LIVE WHERE YOU
PLAY! (id:6289)

Built in 2008

Essential Information



Listing # 10362621

Price $799,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,216

Acres 1.00

Year Built 2008

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Strata

Style Split level entry

Community Information

Address 375 Raven Ridge Road Unit# 301

Subdivision Big White

City Big White

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1P1P3

Amenities

Amenities Cable TV, Whirlpool, Storage - Locker

Features One Balcony

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Attached Garage

# of Garages 1

View Mountain view, Valley view, View (panoramic)

Has Pool Yes

Pool Outdoor pool

Interior

Heating Electric

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Gas

# of Stories 1

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details



Listing Office Sotheby's International Realty Canada
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