
$550,000 - 669 Haywood Street, Penticton
MLS® #10357117 

$550,000
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 651 sqft
Single Family on 0.07 Acres

Main North, Penticton, British Columbia

CLICK TO VIEW VIDEO: Why Rent When You
Can Own? Discover the charm of 669
Haywood Streetâ€”a delightful 2-bedroom,
1-bath bungalow nestled in the heart of
Penticton. Ideal for first-time buyers, investors,
or downsizers seeking stylish one-level living,
this move-in-ready home offers comfort, value,
and timeless appeal. Step inside to a
thoughtfully refreshed interior, where a bright,
modernized kitchen awaits with updated
cabinetry, sleek countertops, contemporary
appliances, and new plumbing. The bathroom
has been tastefully renovated, blending
function with flair in a clean, modern design.
Significant upgradesâ€”newer roof, siding,
soffits, fascia, and hot water tankâ€”provide
peace of mind for years to come. The recently
landscaped yard boasts lava rock accents,
patio stones, and mature greenery, creating a
low-maintenance outdoor oasis. Bonus:
convenient back alley access enhances
parking potential and future flexibility. Located
just minutes from downtown, schools, and
parks, this home offers walkable lifestyle perks
in a quiet, central neighbourhood. Donâ€™t
miss this rare opportunity for affordable
ownership in one of Pentictonâ€™s most
charming enclaves. (id:6289)

Built in 1900

Essential Information

Listing # 10357117



Price $550,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00

Square Footage 651

Acres 0.07

Year Built 1900

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 669 Haywood Street

Subdivision Main North

City Penticton

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V2A4W8

Amenities

Amenities Public Transit, Airport, Park, Recreation, Schools, Shopping

Features Level lot

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Street

Interior

Appliances Refrigerator, Range - Electric

Heating Forced air

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Other

Exterior Features Level

Roof Asphalt shingle

Foundation See Remarks

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office eXp Realty
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