
$849,900 - 51 Cactus Crescent, Osoyoos
MLS® #10344217 

$849,900
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,568 sqft
Single Family on 0.13 Acres

Osoyoos, Osoyoos, British Columbia

This solid, well cared for home features an
attached double garage with a dedicated
workshop area, plus a rare high-clearance
(RV) garage, ideal for your RV, boat, or
oversized truck. Walk in on the main level to a
welcoming living room with a cozy fireplace, a
separate dining area, and a bright, functional
kitchen. Two bedrooms and two full bathrooms
are located on the main floor, including a
primary suite with a 3-piece ensuite and
walk-in closet. Step outside onto the view deck
and take in the peaceful surroundings or enjoy
the second covered deck conveniently located
off the laundry room. Downstairs, youâ€™ll
find a spacious 2-bedroom in-law suite with its
own private entrance, perfect for extended
family or guests. Equipped with a new furnace
and central air conditioning and there is plenty
of extra storage. Situated on a low
maintenance corner lot on a quiet, no-through
street, this home offers both privacy and
convenience. Just minutes from shopping,
dining, and it's near Osoyoos Lake! (id:6289)

Built in 1995

Essential Information

Listing # 10344217

Price $849,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Square Footage 2,568



Acres 0.13

Year Built 1995

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 51 Cactus Crescent

Subdivision Osoyoos

City Osoyoos

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V0H1V1

Amenities

Amenities Golf Nearby, Recreation, Schools, Shopping

Utilities Electricity, Natural Gas, Telephone, Sewer

Features Cul-de-sac, Corner Site, Two Balconies

Parking Spaces 6

Parking Additional Parking, Other, RV

View Lake view, Mountain view

Interior

Appliances Range, Refrigerator, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Water softener

Heating Forced air, Heat Pump, See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Gas

# of Stories 2

Exterior

Exterior Vinyl siding

Exterior Features Landscaped

Roof Asphalt shingle

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details
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